POSTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF MGL 304 §18-25

Board of Health
March 28, 2016

MINUTES

Present: Chairman Gerry Picardi, Robert Ogilvie and Health Agent Tara Tradd as
Recording Secretary.

Meeting called to order at 6:30 P.M.

Office Business:
e Next Board of Health Meeting April 7, 2016
e Warrant for Approval— Warrant in the amount of $449.04 was approved for payment.
e Health Agent Report — So Noted.

New Business:
e Solid Waste and Recycling Collection Contract RFP Opening — The Board opened all
of the RFP’s that were sent in for our new Contract Period commencing on July 1,
2016, please see attached for the summary.

Minutes:

e Minutes to be approved: March 3, 2016 — Ralph Jensen moved to approve the minutes
as submitted, Gerry Picardi seconded, vote carried unanimously.

Meeting Adjourned at: 8:50 PM

ATTEST: DATE:




Avon Solid Waste and Recycling Collection and Disposal RFP YEAR ONE o ) B
Alternate
Price Proposal Cost of Trash | Price Proposal . Cost of Trash .
p. Recyclables Bulky Waste p. Solid Waste Recyclables Bulky Waste Pricing Cost of
Name of One Solid . ) Totes Two Solid ; P . Totes .
Collection and | White Goods < Disposal Per Collection and White Goods . Automated Recycling
Contractor Waste _ Amortized over Waste . Amortized | _
. Transport Collection ) Ton Transport Collection Single Stream Carts
Collection 5 Years Collection over 5 Years )
o Recycling
Sunrise $25.00 P
Scavenger of $319,000.00 $175,000.00 l-t i “h $19,422.00 $275,000.00 580.00 $150,000.00 $25.00 per item $19,422.00 $175,000.00 $22,426.00
Hyde Park €
Waste $284,500.00 $204,140.00 225.00.Pef $14,600.00 $249,820.00 $68.00 $204,140.00 $25.00Peritem | $14,600.00 | $204,140.00 | $17,200.00
Management Item
.00-550.00
Mega Waste of | ¢30¢ 500,00 $207,10000  |*15:005 $21,665.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $190,300.00 | $24,000.00
Seekonk Per Item
! $25.00 - .
bl Includ
Republic $325,584.00 | Included incost1 | $35.00Per | included in cost 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $322,728.00 | 'ncludedinAlt
Waste Price
Item Collected
Howland $13.00 per Included in Alt
X $207,000.00 $61,000.00 Item or $75.00 | Included in Cost 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $61,000.00 neiuaes
Disposal Per Ton Price




